
SOLID WASTE & RECYCLABLE COLLECTION SERVICE BID - 11:00AM 9/2/10
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Option #1A Option #1B Option #2 Option #3

Advanced Recycling NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
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Option #1A Option #1B Option #2 Option #3

Blue Diamond Disposal NO BID $500,000.00 $475,000.00 $550,000.00

$525,000.00 $475,000.00 $575,000.00

$550,000.00 $500,000.00 $600,000.00

$575,000.00 $525,000.00 $625,000.00

$600,000.00 $525,000.00 $650,000.00

$2,750,000.00 $2,500,000.00 $3,000,000.00
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Option #1A Option #1B Option #2 Option #3

Gaeta Recycling $500,500.00 $546,000.00 $455,000.00 $562,400.00

$500,500.00 $546,000.00 $455,000.00 $562,400.00

$500,500.00 $546,000.00 $473,200.00 $584,656.00

$520,520.00 $567,840.00 $492,128.00 $607,802.00

$541,340.00 $590,553.00 $511,813.00 $631,874.00

$2,563,360.00 $2,796,393.00 $2,387,141.00 $2,949,132.00
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Option #1A Option #1B Option #2 Option #3

Peaunnock Disposal $945,672.00 $756,000.00 $706,500.00 $717,050.00

$969,313.00 $774,900.00 $724,162.00 $734,976.00

$993,546.00 $794,272.00 $742,266.00 $753,350.00

$1,018,385.00 $814,129.00 $760,823.00 $772,184.00

$1,043,844.00 $834,482.00 $779,843.00 $791,489.00

$4,970,760.00 $3,973,783.00 $3,713,594.00 $3,769,049.00
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Option #1A Option #1B Option #2 Option #3

Sterling Carting $463,540.00 $463,540.00 $463,540.00 $463,540.00

$470,490.00 $470,490.00 $470,490.00 $470,490.00

$477,550.00 $477,550.00 $477,550.00 $477,550.00

$487,100.00 $487,100.00 $487,100.00 $487,100.00

$496,840.00 $496,840.00 $496,840.00 $496,840.00

$2,395,520.00 $2,395,520.00 $2,395,520.00 $2,395,520.00
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Option #1A Option #1B Option #2 Option #3

Suburban Disposal NO BID $624,000.00 $498,000.00 $624,000.00

$624,000.00 $501,000.00 $624,000.00

$634,000.00 $504,000.00 $634,000.00



$644,000.00 $507,000.00 $644,000.00

$644,000.00 $510,000.00 $644,000.00

$0.00 $3,170,000.00 $2,520,000.00 $3,170,000.00
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Option #1A Option #1B Option #2 Option #3

Waste Industries $655,000.00 $615,000.00 $575,000.00 $550,000.00

$674,000.00 $627,000.00 $586,000.00 $561,000.00

$695,000.00 $639,000.00 $598,000.00 $572,000.00

$715,000.00 $653,000.00 $610,000.00 $584,000.00

$736,000.00 $670,000.00 $622,000.00 $595,000.00

$3,475,000.00 $3,204,000.00 $2,991,000.00 $2,862,000.00
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Option #1A Option #1B Option #2 Option #3

Waste Management $760,522.00 $760,522.00 $693,118.00 $647,624.00

$775,732.00 $775,732.00 $706,980.00 $660,576.00

$791,246.00 $791,246.00 $721,120.00 $673,788.00

$807,070.00 $807,070.00 $735,542.00 $687,264.00

$823,212.00 $823,212.00 $750,252.00 $701,008.00

$3,957,782.00 $3,957,782.00 $3,607,012.00 $3,370,260.00
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Option #4 Option #School District Option #Alternate #2 Option #Alternate #3

NO BID NO BID NO BID $128,000.00

$128,000.00

$128,000.00

$128,000.00

$128,000.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $640,000.00

Page 36 Page 36 Addendum Page Addendum Page

Option #4 Option #School District Option #Alternate #2 Option #Alternate #3

$500,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$525,000.00

$550,000.00

$575,000.00

$600,000.00

$2,750,000.00
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Option #4 Option #School District Option #Alternate #2 Option #Alternate #3

$516,900.00 $45,878.00 $307,320.00 $170,560.00

$516,900.00 $45,878.00 $307,320.00 $170,560.00

$537,336.00 $47,713.00 $319,612.00 $177,382.00

$558,589.00 $49,622.00 $332,397.00 $184,477.00

$580,693.00 $51,606.00 $345,693.00 $191,856.00

$2,710,418.00 $240,697.00 $1,612,342.00 $894,835.00
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Option #4 Option #School District Option #Alternate #2 Option #Alternate #3

$675,000.00 $33,000.00 $540,384.00 $405,288.00

$691,875.00 $33,825.00 $553,893.00 $415,420.00

$709,171.00 $34,670.00 $567,740.00 $425,805.00

$726,901.00 $35,537.00 $581,934.00 $436,450.00

$745,073.00 $36,425.00 $596,482.00 $447,362.00

$3,548,020.00 $173,457.00 $2,840,433.00 $2,130,325.00
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Option #4 Option #School District Option #Alternate #2 Option #Alternate #3

$463,540.00 $99,500.00 NO BID NO BID

$470,490.00 $100,000.00

$477,550.00 $100,500.00

$487,100.00 $101,000.00

$496,840.00 $101,500.00

$2,395,520.00 $502,500.00 $0.00 $0.00
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Option #4 Option #School District Option #Alternate #2 Option #Alternate #3

$498,000.00 $62,000.00 $388,000.00 NO BID

$501,000.00 $62,000.00 $391,000.00

$504,000.00 $62,000.00 $394,000.00



$507,000.00 $62,000.00 $397,000.00

$510,000.00 $62,000.00 $400,000.00

$2,520,000.00 $310,000.00 $1,970,000.00 $0.00

Page 36 Page 36 Addendum Page 1 Addendum Page

Option #4 Option #School District Option #Alternate #2 Option #Alternate #3

$520,800.00 $48,000.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00

$520,800.00 $50,000.00 $370,000.00 $370,000.00

$520,800.00 $52,000.00 $380,000.00 $380,000.00

$520,800.00 $54,000.00 $390,000.00 $390,000.00

$520,800.00 $56,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00

$2,604,000.00 $260,000.00 $1,890,000.00 $1,890,000.00
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Option #4 Option #School District Option #Alternate #2 Option #Alternate #3

$580,210.00 $29,900.00 $421,828.00 $338,694.00

$591,814.00 $30,498.00 $430,264.00 $345,468.00

$603,650.00 $31,108.00 $438,868.00 $352,376.00

$615,722.00 $31,730.00 $447,644.00 $359,422.00

$628,036.00 $32,366.00 $456,598.00 $366,612.00

$3,019,432.00 $155,602.00 $2,195,202.00 $1,762,572.00


